January 23, 1951. Senate File 175
Passed on File. By HENNINGSEN.
Passed Senate, Date ...
Vote: Ayes.....oooeeeeeeeei . Nays. oo
Passed House, Date

Vote: Ayes....cooveeeeeee . Nays...oooe..
Approved ................

A BILL FOR

An Act to provide for biennial elections and six-year terms

for members of the board of directors in independent school

. districts which embrace a city having a population of more
than fifteen thousand and less than one hundred twenty-five
thousand and amend sections two hundred seventy-four point

..seven (274.7), two hundred seventy-seven point one (277.1),
and two hundred seventy-seven point twenty-four (277.24),
Code 1950, relating thereto.

Be It Enacted by the General Assembly of the State of Iowa:

1 Section 1. Section two hundred seventy-four point seven

2 (274.7), Code 1950, is hereby amended by striking the words “one

3 hundred twenty-five thousand” in lines seven (7) and eight (8),

4 and substituting in lieu thereof the words “fifteen thousand”.

1 Sec. 2. Section two hundred seventy-seven point one (277.1),

2 Code 1950, is hereby amended by striking the words ‘“one hundred
3 twenty-five thousand” in lines eight (8) and nine (9), and sub-

4 stituting in lieu thereof the words “fifteen thousand”.

1 Sec. 3. Section two hundred seventy-seven point twenty-

2 four (277.24), Code 1950, is hereby amended by striking the words

“one hundred twenty-five thousand” in lines twelve (12) and

Co

4 thirteen (13), and substituting in lieu thereof the words



0w

10
11

“fifteen thousand”.

Sec. 4. The terms of members of school boards of directors,
in independent districts which embrace a city and which have a
population of fifteen thousand and less than one hundred twenty-
five thousand, as said terms exist on the effective date of this
Act shall be altered as follows:

1. Those whose terms would expire in March 1952 are
extended to the third Monday in March 1953.

2. Those whose terms would expire in March 1953 are extended
to the third Monday in March 1955.

3. Those whose terms would expire in March 1954 are extended

to the third Monday in March 1957.



	SF 0175_Page 0001
	SF 0175_Page 0002

